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Special Quasi-Judicial Standing Committee Minutes
May 24, 2007
	MEMBERS:
	PRESENT:

	K. Krushell, Chair
	K. Krushell

	L. Sloan, Vice-chair
	L. Sloan

	T. Cavanagh
	T. Cavanagh

	D. Thiele
	


Also in Attendance:

D. Fisher, Corporate Services Department (Law)

J. Johnson, Corporate Services Department (Law)

J. Wright, Office of the City Clerk



A.
CALL TO ORDER AND RELATED BUSINESS
A.1.
CALL TO ORDER

Councillor K. Krushell called the meeting to order at 1:40 p.m.

A.5.
EXPLANATION OF THE APPEAL HEARING PROCESS
Councillor K. Krushell asked if anyone objected to any Member of the Quasi-Judicial Standing Committee hearing the order review.  No one objected.

Q.
QUASI-JUDICIAL STANDING COMMITTEE MATTERS

Q.1.
Edmonton International Airport Taxi Service – Order Review  Hearing
Councillor K. Krushell explained the hearing process.

J. Wright, Office of the City Clerk, answered the Committee’s questions.

P. K., representing Airport Taxi Service, answered the Committee’s questions.

J. Wright, Office of the City Clerk, answered the Committee’s questions.
Moved  L. Sloan:

That P. K., representing Airport Taxi Service, and
M. Garrett, Planning and Development Department, be given an additional five minutes each to make their presentations.

CARRIED

For the Motion:
T. Cavanagh, K. Krushell, L. Sloan.

Moved  K. Krushell:

That the Quasi-Judicial Standing Committee hear from the following:

1. T. B., Edmonton Airports

2. D. T., Edmonton Airports

3. P. S., Yellow Cabs

4. A. A.

5. B. H., Capital Taxi

6. R. C., General Manager, Alberta Co-op Taxi

7. J. S., Yellow Cabs

8. G. G., Drivers Association

9. M. P., Drivers Association

10. J. K., Airport Taxi Service

11. L. D., Airport Taxi Service

12. A. A., Airport Taxi Service

13. R. S., Airport Taxi Service

14. Z. A., Airport Taxi Service

15. M. A., Airport Taxi Service

16. H. A., Capital Taxi Service
17. J. R., Airport Taxi Service
18. H. S. I., Airport Taxi Service
19. A. A. N., Airport Taxi Service
20. A. O., Airport Taxi Service
21. A. J., Airport Taxi Service
22. A. Z., Prestige Cabs

23. R. J., Airport Taxi Service
24. C. R., Airport Taxi Service
25. R. S., Airport Taxi Service
26. J. M., Airport Taxi Service
27. A. K. B., Airport Taxi Service
28. M. A., Airport Taxi Service
29. M. W., Airport Taxi Service
30. G. S., Airport Taxi Service
31. M. F., Airport Taxi Service
32. M. R., Airport Taxi Service
33. M. M., Airport Taxi Service
34. A. J., Airport Taxi Service
35. S. A., Capital Taxi

36. M. M., A-1 Taxi

CARRIED

For the Motion:
T. Cavanagh, K. Krushell, L. Sloan.

J. Wright, Office of the City Clerk, answered the Committee’s questions.

P. K., on behalf of Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation and answered the Committee’s questions.  P. K. referred to the following documents which were distributed to Members of the Committee and a copy was filed with the Office of the City Clerk:

a. A letter dated May 23, 2007, to the Quasi-Judicial Standing Committee with attachments. 

b. Copies of Edmonton and Area Yellow Pages Taxicabs advertisements.

c. R. v. Roy, Regina v. Roy, and Regina v. Goodman judgment dated October 2, 1972.

Moved  T. Cavanagh:

That the Committee hear from R. S., Director, Airport Taxi Service.

CARRIED

For the Motion:
T. Cavanagh, K. Krushell, L. Sloan.

R. S., Director, Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation and answered the Committee’s questions.

M. Garrett and P. Fearon, Planning and Development Department; and
S. Phipps, Corporate Services Department (Law), made presentations and answered the Committee’s questions. The following documents were submitted to Members of the Committee and a copy was filed with the Office of the City Clerk:

a. Edmonton International Airport Taxi Service – Stop Order Appeal Hearing report dated May 15, 2007.

b. United Taxi Drivers v. Calgary decision.

The Committee recessed at 3:27 p.m.

The Committee reconvened at 3:37 p.m.

P. Fearon, Planning and Development Department; and S. Phipps, Corporate Services Department (Law), answered the Committee’s questions.

T. B., Edmonton Airports; P. S., Yellow Cabs; A. A.; 
B. H., General Manager, Capital Taxi; R. C., General Manager, Alberta Co-op Taxi; J. S., Yellow Cabs; G. G. and M. P., Drivers Association; J. K. and L. D., Airport Taxi Service, made presentations. T. B. and D. T., Edmonton Airports; P. S.; A. A.; G. G.; and J. K., answered the Committee’s questions.

P. S. distributed a copy of the Supreme Court of Canada judgement dated 2004 March 8 – United Taxi Drivers v. Calgary, to  Members of the Committee and a copy was filed with the Office of the City Clerk.  

J. K. distributed a copy of his presentation to Members of the Committee and a copy was filed with the Office of the City Clerk.

The Committee recessed at 4:54 p.m. to allow the additional speakers to be seated.

The Committee reconvened at 5:13 p.m.

A. A. and M. A., Airport Taxi Service; H. A., Capital Taxi; and A. K. B., Airport Taxi Service, made presentations.  A. K. B. answered the Committee’s questions.

Moved  T. Cavanagh:

That Orders of the Day be extended to complete the hearing and that the Committee recess from 6 p.m. to 6:30 p.m. for a dinner break. 

CARRIED

For the Motion:
T. Cavanagh, K. Krushell, L. Sloan.

M. A. and G. S., Airport Taxi Service, made presentations and answered the Committee’s questions.

P. K. indicated he had a prior commitment and would not be in attendance at the meeting after the dinner break.

The Committee acknowledged P. K.’s prior commitment and asked whether the applicant had any objection to the hearing proceeding in his absence.  P. Kirwin stated he had no objection because the Directors of the Alberta Taxi Service would be available to respond to new information.

The Committee recessed at 6 p.m.

The Committee reconvened at 6:36 p.m.

A. A. N., H. S. I., M. M., Airport Taxi Service; S. A., Capital Taxi; A. Z., Prestige Cabs; C. R., Airport Taxi Service; M. M., A-1 Taxi; and J. M., Airport Taxi Service, made presentations.  A. A. N. and H. S. I. answered the Committee’s questions.

R. S. and S. S., Directors, Airport Taxi Service, made closing comments, responded to new information and answered the Committee’s questions.

S. Phipps, Corporate Services Department (Law), made closing comments, responded to new information and answered the Committee’s questions.  P. Fearon, Planning and Development Department, answered the Committee’s questions.  A copy of a letter dated November 30, 2006, from P. Fearon, Planning and Development Department, to R. S., Airport Taxi Service, was distributed to Members of the Committee and a copy was filed with the Office of the City Clerk.

R. S. responded to new information.

Moved  T. Cavanagh:

That the Committee meet in private pursuant to section 4 of the Freedom of Information and Protection of Privacy Act.
CARRIED

For the Motion:
T. Cavanagh, K. Krushell, L. Sloan.

The Committee met in private at 8:07 p.m.

Moved  L. Sloan:

That the Committee meet in public.

CARRIED

For the Motion:
T. Cavanagh, K. Krushell, L. Sloan.

The Committee met in public at 9:28 p.m.

DECISION BY THE QUASI-JUDICIAL STANDING COMMITTEE ON REVIEW OF ORDER DATED MAY 8, 2007, 1254582 ALBERTA LTD. O/A AIRPORT TAXI SERVICE
In dealing with this review of an Order dated May 8, 2007, issued to 1254582 Alberta Ltd. o/a Airport Taxi Service, the Quasi Judicial Standing Committee has considered the following evidence:
1.
P. K., made a presentation on behalf of Airport Taxi Service, answered the Committee’s questions and submitted the following documents:

a. A letter dated May 23, 2007, to the Quasi Judicial Standing Committee with attachments.
b. Copies of Edmonton and Area Yellow Pages Taxicabs advertisements.

c. R. v. Roy, Regina v. Roy, and  Regina v. Goodman judgement dated October 2, 1972.
2.
R. S., Director, Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation and later made closing comments and responded to new information on behalf of Airport Taxi Service and answered the Committee’s questions.

3.
P. Fearon, S. Phipps and M. Garrett made a presentation and later made closing comments and responded to new information on behalf of Administration, answered the Committee’s questions and submitted the following documents:

a. Edmonton International Airport Taxi service – Stop Order Appeal Hearing report dated May 15, 2007.

b. United Taxi Drivers v. Calgary decision.
c. A letter dated November 30, 2006, to R. S., Airport Taxi Service.
4.
T. B., Edmonton Airports, made a presentation. T. B. and D. T. answered the Committee’s questions and submitted a Council report dated March 29, 2007, titled Edmonton International Airport Taxi Service.

5.
P. S., Yellow Cab, made a presentation, answered the Committee’s questions and resubmitted a Supreme Court of Canada judgment dated 2004 March 8 – United Taxi Drivers v. Calgary.
6.
A. A. made a presentation and answered the Committee’s questions.
7.
B. H., Capital Taxi, made a presentation.
8.
R. C., Alberta Co-op Taxi, made a presentation.
9.
J. S., Yellow Cab, made a presentation.
10.
G. G., Drivers Association, made a presentation and answered the Committee’s questions.

11.
M. P., Drivers Association, made a presentation.
12.
J. K., Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation and answered the Committee’s questions.
13.
L. D., Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation.
14.
A. A., Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation.
15.
M. A., Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation.

16.
H. A., Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation.
17.
A. K. B., Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation and answered the Committee’s questions.

18.
M. A., Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation and answered the Committee’s questions.
19.
G. S., Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation and answered the Committee’s questions.

20.
A. A. N., Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation and answered the Committee’s questions.

21.
H. S. I., Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation and answered the Committee’s questions.

22.
M. M., Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation.

23.
S. A., Capital Taxi, made a presentation.

24.
A. Z., Prestige Cabs, made a presentation.

25.
C. R., Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation.

26.
M. M., A-1 Taxi, made a presentation.

27.
J. M., Airport Taxi Service, made a presentation. 

Finding of Fact:

Based on the evidence presented, the Quasi Judicial Standing Committee finds:

1.
That the City of Edmonton was operating within its jurisdiction when it enforced Edmonton Taxi Bylaw 12020 and issued the Order dated May 8, 2007.

2.
That the Airport Taxi Service was operating a taxi service within the city of Edmonton without a licence.

3.
Operating the Airport Taxi Service within the city of Edmonton was a contravention of the Edmonton Taxi Bylaw.

Decision of the Committee:

Moved  K. Krushell:

	That the Order not be set aside but varied as follows:

That the following be added in the “Therefore Section” after “1)  Forthwith cease accepting orders for and dispatching Taxis to pick up passengers within the city of Edmonton”:



unless the following conditions have been met:

a.  1254582 Alberta Ltd. meets all the requirements for being licensed as a Taxi Broker under the City of Edmonton Taxi Bylaw 12020, and is licensed as a Taxi Broker by the City of Edmonton;

b.   the drivers of the taxis that are dispatched hold a valid and subsisting Taxi Driver’s Licence or Temporary Taxi Driver’s Licence issued by the City of Edmonton; and

c.   the Taxis that are dispatched hold valid and subsisting Edmonton Taxi Licence plates.

(Complete varied Order is outlined in Attachment 1)
	Planning & Dev.
cont.

Planning & Dev.


Carried 

For the Motion:
T. Cavanagh, K. Krushell, L. Sloan.

Reasons:

1. Section 32 of The Edmonton Taxi Bylaw 12020 states “No person shall operate a Taxi unless that person has been issued and has in his possession a valid and subsisting Taxi Driver’s license or a Temporary Taxi Drivers License.”

2. Airport Taxi Service is acting as a taxi service and not as a shuttle service.

3. Airport Taxi Service is not licensed to operate a taxi in Edmonton.  The Airport Taxi Service’s contract with the Airport Authority is to pick up passengers at the airport and drop them off in Edmonton and areas surrounding Edmonton.  The contract does not override the City of Edmonton Taxi Bylaw.  Picking up passengers without valid City of Edmonton taxi licences, pre-arranged or not, in Edmonton contravenes Edmonton’s Taxi Bylaw.

4. The Committee considered submissions on past enforcement practices, and did not find this evidence to be a sufficient basis to set aside the Order.

S.
ADJOURNMENT

The meeting adjourned at 9:38 p.m.

________________________

________________________

Chair





City Clerk

May 8, 2007 ORDER issued to 1254582 Alberta Ltd. and the three Directors of the Corporation.

[image: image1.png]PLANNING AND
DEVELOPMENT

¢dmonto




Date:   May 8, 2007






O R D E R

(Issued Pursuant to Section 545(1) of the Municipal Government Act, R.S.A. 2000 c. M-26)
TO:
1254582 Alberta Ltd. 


1254582 Alberta Ltd.


Susan McFadzen

Sid Slach

Robert Sterr

RE:
1254582 Alberta Ltd o/a Airport Taxi Service
WHEREAS:  Bylaw 12020, the City of Edmonton Taxi Bylaw (the “Taxi Bylaw”) contains the following sections:

2.
In this Bylaw, unless the context otherwise requires:

(v)
"Taxi" means a motor vehicle for hire with a driver;

(w)
"Taxi Broker" means a person who carries on the business of accepting orders for or dispatching taxis in any manner;

(x)
"Taxi Driver" means a person who is licensed to drive a taxi pursuant to this Bylaw;

(y)
“Taxi Drivers License” means a license issued pursuant to this Bylaw that permits a person to drive a taxi;

(z)
“Taxi License” means a license issued pursuant to this Bylaw that permits a vehicle to be operated as a taxi;

(aa)
“Temporary Taxi Drivers License” means a license issued pursuant to Section 37 of this Bylaw;

12.
No person shall carry on the business of a Taxi Broker unless licensed to do so under the provisions of this Bylaw.

20.
A Taxi Broker shall not permit any person to drive a Taxi under his direction, except a person who holds a Taxi Driver’s License or a Temporary Taxi Driver’s License.

32.
No person shall operate a Taxi unless that person has been issued and has in his possession a valid and subsisting Taxi Driver’s license or a Temporary Taxi Drivers License.

41.
No person shall operate a Taxi unless the Taxi is Licensed.

     (1)
No person shall permit a Taxi to be operated unless the Taxi is Licensed.

67.
A person who fails to do anything which that person is required to do under this Bylaw or the Regulations or who does anything prohibited by this Bylaw or the Regulations is guilty of an offence and liable to a fine in the amount as specified in Schedule “B”, and in default of payment to up to one year imprisonment, or both.

AND WHEREAS:

(1) 1254582 Alberta Ltd. (hereinafter “Airport Taxi Service”) is a corporation incorporated in the Province of Alberta and carries on business under the name of Airport Taxi Service;


(2) Susan McFadzen, Sid Slach and Robert Sterr are all directors of 1254582 Alberta Ltd.


(3) Airport Taxi Service is accepting orders for and dispatching Taxis to pick up passengers within the City of Edmonton;


(4) Airport Taxi Service is permitting persons who do not hold Taxi Driver’s Licences or Temporary Taxi Driver’s Licences to drive Taxis under its direction to pick up passengers within the City of Edmonton;


(5) Persons operating Taxis under the direction of Airport Taxi Service are picking up passengers within the City of Edmonton without having or being in possession of a valid and subsisting Taxi Driver’s Licence or Temporary Taxi Driver’s Licence;


(6) Airport Taxi Service is permitting the operation of Taxis that do not have a valid and subsisting Taxi Licence plate to pick up passengers within the City of Edmonton;


(7) Persons are operating Taxis under the direction of Airport Taxi Service to pick up passengers within the City of Edmonton without the Taxi having a valid and subsisting Taxi Licence plate.

(8)
Airport Taxi Service and at least one of its directors have publicly stated they are aware of these contraventions and have no plans to comply with the Taxi Bylaw.

THEREFORE:  Being an employee of the City of Edmonton, having the delegated power, duties and functions of a designated officer for the purposes of section 545, I find that there are contraventions of Bylaw 12020, the City of Edmonton Taxi Bylaw, and in particular contravention of sections 12, 20, 32, and 41, and that these contraventions constitute offences pursuant to section 67 of the Bylaw.
AND THEREFORE:  Being a designated officer I hereby order:

1)
1254582 Alberta Ltd. (also known as Airport Taxi Service);

2)
Susan McFadzen (a director of Airport Taxi Service);

3)
Sid Slach (a director of Airport Taxi Service); and 

4)
Robert Sterr (a director of Airport Taxi Service);

all being persons responsible for the contraventions of Bylaw 12020, the City of Edmonton Taxi Bylaw, described above as follows:
1) Forthwith cease accepting orders for and dispatching Taxis to pick up passengers within the City of Edmonton unless the following conditions have been met:

a. 1254582 Alberta Ltd. meets all the requirements for being licensed as a Taxi Broker under the City of Edmonton Taxi Bylaw 12020, and is licensed as a Taxi Broker by the City of Edmonton;

b. the drivers of the taxis that are dispatched hold a valid and subsisting Taxi Driver’s Licence or Temporary Taxi Driver’s Licence issued by the City of Edmonton; and

c. the Taxis that are dispatched hold valid and subsisting Edmonton Taxi Licence plates.
2) Forthwith cease permitting persons who do not hold a Taxi Drivers Licence or a Temporary Taxi Drivers Licence to drive Taxis under the direction of Airport Taxi Service to pick up passengers within the City of Edmonton;

3) Forthwith advise all persons driving Taxis under the direction of Airport Taxi Service to not pick up passengers within the City of Edmonton unless they hold a Taxi Driver's Licence or a Temporary Taxi Driver’s Licence;

4) Forthwith cease permitting the operation of Taxis that do not have a valid and subsisting Taxi Licence plate to pick up passengers within the City of Edmonton; 

and

5) Forthwith advise all persons operating Taxis under the direction of Airport Taxi Service to not pick up passengers within the City of Edmonton unless the Taxi has a valid and subsisting Taxi Licence plate.


YOU MUST COMPLY WITH THIS ORDER IMMEDIATELY.
________________________________

Officer: Phil Fearon MEO # 2 Telephone: 496-5247 

Chief Licence Inspector
Development Compliance Branch

INDEX

QUASI-JUDICIAL STANDING COMMITTEE MEETING

MAY 24, 2007

1A.
CALL TO ORDER AND RELATED BUSINESS



1A.1.  CALL TO ORDER


    1A.5.
EXPLANATION OF THE APPEAL HEARING PROCESS


1Q.
QUASI-JUDICIAL STANDING COMMITTEE MATTERS


    1Q.1. Edmonton International Airport Taxi Service – Order Review 

 Hearing


8S.
ADJOURNMENT



 

MAILING ADDRESS:


5th FLOOR,


10250 – 101 STREET NW


EDMONTON, ALBERTA   T5J 3P4














PAGE  
Special Quasi-Judicial Standing Committee Minutes   |   May 24, 2007, nr
1 of 1

